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Item Description Charm-Tex | Goaltex |Gold Water| Horizon Tabb Tex. | Uniform Mfg.
1 Coverall - Yellow, X-Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Yellow, Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Yellow, M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Yellow, L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.20
Coverall - Yellow, XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.50
Coverall - Yellow, 1XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00
Coverall - Yellow, 2XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.25
Coverall - Yellow, 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.90
Coverall - Yellow, 4XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.25
Coverall - Yellow, 5XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.75
Coverall - Yellow, 6XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Yellow, 7XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Yellow, 8XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Yellow, 9XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Yellow, 10XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Yellow, 11XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Yellow, 12XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.50
Coverall - Yellow, 13XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00
Coverall - Yellow, 14XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00
Coverall - Yellow, 15XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00
Coverall - Navy BI, X-Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.23
Coverall - Navy Bl, Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.23
Coverall - Navy Bl, M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.23
Coverall - Navy BI, L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.23
Coverall - Navy BI, XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 1XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 2XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.56
Coverall - Navy BI, 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.56
Coverall - Navy BI, 4XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 5XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.50
Coverall - Navy BI, 6XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 7XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 8XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 9XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 10XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 11XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 12XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.50
Coverall - Navy BI, 13XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 14XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.00
Coverall - Navy BI, 15XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00
Coverall - Orange, X-Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Orange, Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Orange, M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Orange, L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.20
Coverall - Orange, XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.50
Coverall - Orange, 1XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00
Coverall - Orange, 2XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.25
Coverall - Orange, 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.90
Coverall - Orange, 4XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.25
Coverall - Orange, 5XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.75
Coverall - Orange, 6XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Orange, 7XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Orange, 8XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Orange, 9XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Orange, 10XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Orange, 11XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Orange, 12XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.50
Coverall - Orange, 13XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00
Coverall - Orange, 14XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00
Coverall - Orange, 15XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00
Coverall - Red, X-Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Red, Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Red, M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.67
Coverall - Red, L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.20
Coverall - Red, XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.50
Coverall - Red, 1XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.00
Coverall - Red, 2XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.25
Coverall - Red, 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.90
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Item Description Charm-Tex | Goaltex |Gold Water| Horizon Tabb Uniform Mfg.
Coverall - Red, 4XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.25
Coverall - Red, 5XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.75
Coverall - Red, 6XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Red, 7XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Red, 8XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.25
Coverall - Red, 9XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Red, 10XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Red, 11XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00
Coverall - Red, 12XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.50
Coverall - Red, 13XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00
Coverall - Red, 14XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00
Coverall - Red, 15XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00
2 Navy Cruiser Shoes, 5 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 7.95
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 6 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.85
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 7 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.85
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 8 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.75
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 9 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.75
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 10 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.75
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 11 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.75
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 12 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.75
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 13 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.75
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 14 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.45
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 15 4.18 4.21 2.50| No Bid No Bid 2.45
3 Shower Shoes Pr-5 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 6 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 7 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 8 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 9 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 10 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 11 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 12 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 13 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 14 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 15 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
Shower Shoes Pr - 16 1.41 No Bid 1.42 No Bid No Bid 1.95
4 Gown-S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.00
Gown - M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.00
Gown - L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.00
Gown - 1XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.00
Gown - 2XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.00
Gown - 3XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00
Gown - 4XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00
Gown - 5XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00

5 Mattress 43.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Mattress Cover 5.18 No Bid No Bid 7.56 No Bid No Bid
7 Blanket 5.26| No Bid No Bid 8.52 6.00 8.99
8 Bath Towel 8.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.75 10.50
9 Laundry Bag 2.33] NoBid No Bid 2.38 NoBid 2.40

Charm-Tex

1618 Coney Island Ave.
Brooklyn, NY 11230
Attn: Ben Danzger
Phone: 718-252-8100
Fax: 718-258-8303
Ben@charm-tex.com

Horizon Products
53 Union St.
Brighton, MA 02135
Attn: Joe Savitz

Ph: 617-787-1798
Fax: 617-562-0942
Zeusrsl@aol.com

Goal Tex Corporation
146 Split Rock Road
Syosset, NY 11791
Attn: Robert Grubman
Ph: 516-682-5775
Fax: 516-682-5718
Robert@goaltex.com

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.
511 Pleasant Drive
Opelika, AL 36801
Attn: Marsha Thrift
Ph: 334-745-6762
Fax: 334-745-2377
tabb@textilegroup.net

Gold Water Industries
17221 S. Western Ave.
Gardena, CA 90247-5225
Attn: Jack Wang

Ph: 310-538-4560

Fax: 310-538-5169
bids@goldwaterusa.com

Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

PO Box 12716

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Attn: Susan Polo

Ph: 800-222-1474

Fax: 480-368-8556
Susan@umidirect.com




